
Bid Items Bugman of Rochester
Lady Bug All Pest 

Solutions Inc.

Rentokil North America, 
Inc DBA Ehrlich Pest 

Control

Bugs Bee Gone Pest 
Control Inc

Zen Capo, Inc. DBA 
Pestmaster of Central 

NY

Residential and 
Commercial Pest Pros 

LLC

Innovative Pest 
Management, Corp.

Chemung 
County

NO BID $8,365.00 $2,250.00 $11,025.00 $5,840.00 NO BID $7,806.00

Livingston 
County

NO BID $29,055.00 $8,350.00 $41,475.00 $21,960.00 $25,005.00 $29,272.00*

Monroe 
County

$16,690.00 $40,270.00* $14,500.00 $70,835.00 $38,784.00 $33,630.00 $34,772.00*

Ontario 
County

NO BID $22,670.00* $7,900.00 $40,560.00 $20,792.00 $25,770.00 $28,574.00

Schuyler 
County

NO BID $4,050.00 $900.00 $4,240.00 $2,336.00 NO BID $2,964.00

Seneca 
County

NO BID $12,105.00 $3,210.00 $15,825.00 $8,504.00 NO BID $10,167.00

Steuben 
County

NO BID $14,000.00* $2,760.00 $14,200.00 $7,336.00* NO BID $9,720.00

Wayne 
County

NO BID $31,865.00 $11,550.00 $56,250.00 $30,840.00* NO BID $30,684.00

Wyoming 
County

NO BID $10,855.00 $2,510.00 $13,890.00 $6,400.00 NO BID $13,730.00

Yates County NO BID $6,820.00 $1,800.00 $8,760.00 $4,672.00 NO BID $7,056.00

     *Math Corrected

IFB FL 031623: 2023 - 2028 Pest Control Services for Community Homes in Chemung, Livingston, Monroe, Ontario, Schuyler, Seneca, Steuben, 
Wayne, Wyoming, and Yates Counties


